Silver Lake Township March 4, 2019

Francis Fruehan called the meeting to order at 7:00 pm and called a salute to the Flag.

Minutes from the February meeting were read and approved on a motion made by Evan Everitt and seconded by Butch DeLousia, all approved.

The Treasurer's report was read, approved and held for audit on a motion made by Evan Everitt and seconded by Butch DeLousia, all approved.

Public Comment: None

Evan Everitt opened bids for advertised materials:

Pipe: Bradco Supply – 15" pipe 7.71/ft. and collar at \$11.35/ea.; 18" pipe 10.30/ft and collar at \$19.34/ea; 24" \$16.85/ft and collar \$27.19/ea.; 4" perforated pipe \$.50/ft and coupler \$2.08/ea; 6" perforated pipe \$1.41/ft and coupler \$4.14/ea.

Fuels: WOC Energy – Unleaded gasoline \$1.8510/gal; Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel \$2.3630/gal.; and Heating Oil \$2.3050/gal.

Material: F.S.Lopke -- #57 \$10.50/ton picked up and \$16.00/ton delivered; #8 \$11.00/ton picked up and \$16.50/ton delivered; 2A \$7.00/ton picked up and \$12.50/ton delivered; 2RC \$7.00/ton picked up and \$12.50/ton delivered; #67 \$11.00/ton picked up and \$16.50/ton delivered; 6" Minus \$6.50/ton picked up and \$12.00/ton delivered; 8" Minus \$6.50/ton picked up and \$12.00/ton delivered.

L & D Stoneworks –DSA \$6.00/ton picked up and \$11.00/ton delivered; 2A \$5.50/ton picked up and \$10.50/ton delivered/ #8 \$8.00/ton picked up and \$13.00/ton delivered; #57 \$7.50/ton picked up and \$12.50/ton delivered; #67 \$7.75/ton picked up and \$12.75/ton delivered; 2RC \$4.50/ton picked up and \$9.50/ton delivered; 6" Minus \$4.50/ton picked up and \$9.50/ton delivered; 8" Minus \$4.25/ton picked up and \$9.50/ton delivered; 4" Minus \$4.75/ton picked up and \$9.75/ton delivered.

NE Lime and Stone – DSA \$13.30/ton picked up and \$25.70/ton delivered; 2A \$8.25/ton picked up and \$20.65/ton delivered; #8 \$17.30/ton picked up and \$29.70/ton delivered; #57 \$12.90/ton picked up and \$25.30/ton delivered; 8" Minus \$10.00/ton picked up and \$23.40/ton delivered. #67 - no bid; 2RC- no bid; 6" Minus - no bid; 4" Minus - no bid.

Hourly Triaxle: L & D Stoneworks \$80.00/Hr.; Dick Rockefeller \$80.00/Hr.; GL Parrish \$81.57/Hr.; Rip's Truck'n \$78.00/Hr.; JP Reilly \$85.00/Hr.

Flake Calcium: GL Parrish \$539 per ton delivered in super sacks.

Evan Everitt made a motion to approve bids for: WOC Energy for all fuels, Bradco Supply for all pipes, GL Parrish for flake calcium; approve material bids from all bidders and approve all hourly triaxle bids, Butch DeLousia seconded, all approved.

Evan Everitt would like to advertise some items on Auctions International – 45,000 Lb Hydraulic Winch, Diesel Generator for parts, and power washer. Evan Everitt made a motion to advertise items on Auctions International, Francis Fruehan seconded, all approved. Evan Everitt said Supervisors are looking at replacing the garage. They are looking to see what options are available. Looking into whether prevailing wage would have to be paid. The existing garage has a number of problems that would be very costly to try and repair.

Francis Fruehan gave the police report with 7 incidents and 1 traffic stop for the month of February.

Evan Everitt gave road report – Taking care of winter road maintenance.

Assessment Permits - none

Driveway and Roadcrossing Permits - none

Butch DeLousia made a motion to pay the bills as submitted, Evan Everitt seconded, all approved.

As no further business was presented, Francis Fruehan made a motion to adjourn the meeting, Butch DeLousia seconded.

Sandy Brink Secretary Supervisors Present: Francis Fruehan Evan Everitt Richard DeLousia